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Program Manager – Cybersecurity Enablement
Job Location
United States
Remote work from: USA

Base Salary
USD 40 - USD 50

Employment Type
Full-time, Part-time

Description
Who we are lululemon is an innovative performance apparel company for yoga,
running, training, and other athletic pursuits. Setting the bar in technical fabrics and
functional design, we create transformational products and experiences that
support people in moving, growing, connecting, and being well. We owe our
success to our innovative product, emphasis on stores, commitment to our people,
and the incredible connections we make in every community we’re in.

As a company, we focus on creating positive change to build a healthier, thriving
future. In particular, that includes creating an equitable, inclusive and growth-
focused environment for our people. About this team The lululemon Cybersecurity
team enables lululemon to conduct its global operations in a secure manner and
safeguard the trusted information of its guests and educators.

This is accomplished by understanding risks, developing mitigation plans and
continuously maturing capabilities & services. To further enhance our team, we are
looking for a Program Manager – Cybersecurity Cyber Enablement Services, with
demonstrated expertise in program management, product management and people
enablement. A day in the life: The Program Manager is responsible for the overall
delivery of either a group of related projects, 1-2 programs across 3+ functions
within lululemon, or 3+ well established and mature scrum/operational teams.

The Program Manager oversees the Project Managers, Analysts, and Engineers
responsible for tactical delivery of key outcomes for the program delivered via agile
and/or waterfall methodologies. They will work closely with the business/product
partners, technology/business stakeholders, architecture, portfolio & core delivery
teams. Supports the development of models & frameworks focused on
Cybersecurity demand management, scoping & assessment of new opportunities,
and delivery of strategic programs Responsible for overall delivery of a well-
established capability in the program from planning to development that serves a
long-term business objective Manages the assigned program including but not
limited to managing established and mature products, teams, capability or category
or technology solution implementation or migration Creates overall timeline,
stakeholder analysis, communication plan, cross-functional dependencies,
reporting structure to track progress across multiple workstreams with guidance
from Sr.

Program Manage or Technology Manager Effectively identifies and solves for
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potential risks, issues, and development strategies to prevent realization of risks
while providing transparency to the applicable stakeholders Unblocks the team and
proactively problem solves as needed throughout the program lifecycle with
guidance from peers & leaders Validates that the project delivers the expected
outcomes, supports business objectives, is of quality Guides and coaches the
Project Managers to ensure the objectives of a project are understood,
documented, and measurable Manages Program budget (actuals & forecast)
Onboarding & offboarding of resources Owns program related resource
management and 3rd party vendor management. Point of Contact for Procurement,
Security, Legal, Stakeholder Management (Sponsor, Leadership, Architects)
Develops relationships and collaborates with internal and external stakeholders
across regions (NA, EMEA, APAC, China) and cross functional teams to ensure
solutions meet timeline and business objectives. Ensures all project/program tasks
are clearly understood, assigned, and tracked.
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